- USTRALIA

- })»)5{:.‘\{ 7

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment
Determination (No. 3) 2024

We, the members of the Remuneration Tribunal, make the following determination.

Dated 5 June 2024

el o

Holly Kramer Heather Zampatti Stephen Conry AM
President Member Member

OPC66984 - A






Contents

w N -

4

(000 ¢ 01CT g Tod=T 1 4 =T 1 A USSR TPRRPUPRN
AULNOTTEY ¢ttt bt bbb b et sb e b e e b e b b
SCNEAUIBS ...ttt ettt et e et e e et e e be e s b e e ereeeateesaeeenrs

Schedule 1—Amendments

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full-time
Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Part-time
Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

OPC66984 - A

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024






1 Name

This instrument is the Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 3)
2024.

2 Commencement

(1) Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences,
or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any
other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

Commencement information

Column1 Column 2 Column 3
Provisions Commencement Date/Details
1. The whole of this The day after this instrument is registered.
instrument
Note: This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will

not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.

(2) Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument.
Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in
any published version of this instrument.

3 Authority

This instrument is made under subsections 7(3) and (4) of the Remuneration
Tribunal Act 1973.

4 Schedules

Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any
other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024 1
OPC66984 - A



Schedule 1 Amendments

Schedule 1—Amendments

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Full-time Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

1 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Director-General,
Australian Signals Directorate)

Insert:

Director of Public Prosecutions $710,700 1

2 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Director-General,
Australian Submarine Agency)

Insert:
Chief Executive Officer, National Disability Insurance $687,000 Table 2B, 1
Agency item 13
Table 6A,
item 3

3 Section 10 (Table 2A, table item dealing with Director of Public
Prosecutions)

Repeal the item.

4 Section 10 (Table 2A, table item dealing with Chief Executive Officer,
National Disability Insurance Agency)

Repeal the item.

5 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Information
Commissioner)

Insert:

Chief Commissioner, Infrastructure Australia $503,420 Table 6A, 1
item 4

6 Section 10 (Table 2A, cell at table item dealing with National Disability
Insurance Scheme Quality and Safeguards Commissioner, column
3)

Repeal the cell.

7 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Deputy Director,
Classification Board)

Insert:

Defence Family Advocate, Defence Families of Australia $178,000 3

2 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024
OPC66984 - A



Amendments Schedule 1

8 Section 11 (Table 2B, table item 11)
Repeal the item.

9 Section 11 (Table 2B, table item 13, column 2)

Omit “$166,260 for the period beginning on 8 December 2022 and ending on 7 June
20247, substitute “$71,510 for the period beginning on 8 June 2024 and ending on
17 October 2025”.

10 Subsection 19(6) (Table 5A, table item 4, column 2)
Omit “until 18 May 2024”, substitute “from 18 May 2024 until 18 May 2026 .

11 Subsection 19(6) (Table 5A, table item 4, column 3)
Omit “$40,000”, substitute “$20,000”.

12 Subsection 22(4) (Table 5B, table item 5, column 2)
Omit “until 18 May 2024”, substitute “from 18 May 2024 until 18 May 2026.

13 Subsection 22(4) (Table 5B, table item 5, column 3)
Omit “$21,000”, substitute “$18,000”.

14 Section 23 (at the end of Table 6A)

Add:

3 Table 2A, item dealing with This item, as inserted by the Remuneration Tribunal
Chief Executive Officer, Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024, applies on and
National Disability Insurance after 8 June 2024.
Agency

4 Table 2A, item dealing with This item, as inserted by the Remuneration Tribunal
Chief Commissioner, Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024, applies on and
Infrastructure Australia after 15 April 2024.

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Part-time Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

15 Section 16 (Table 3A, after table item dealing with Tax Practitioners
Board)

Insert:

Clean Energy Finance $128,120 $63,690 1

Corporation

16 Section 16 (Table 3A, table item dealing with Infrastructure Australia)
Repeal the item.

17 Section 16 (Table 3A, table item dealing with Clean Energy Finance
Corporation)

Repeal the item.

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024 3
OPC66984 - A



Schedule 1 Amendments

18 Section 16 (Table 3A, after table item dealing with Northern Territory
Aboriginal Investment Corporation Audit and Risk Committee)

Insert:
Infrastructure Australia, $133,290 Table 8A, 1
Commissioner item 4

19 Section 17 (Table 3B, table item 11A, column 2)
After “Audit”, insert “and Risk”.

20 Section 46 (at the end of Table 8A)

Add:

4 Table 3A, item dealing with This item, as inserted by the Remuneration Tribunal
Infrastructure Australia, Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024, applies on and
Commissioner after 15 April 2024.

4 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 3) 2024

OPC66984 - A



